PROJECT:
PROJECT NUMBER:
BID OPENING DATE & TIME:

RE-BID HVAC REPLACEMENTS AT KNAPP ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS

2016138.02

THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 9, 2017, 2PM

CONTRACT:

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION

L.J. Paolella Construction,

BIDDERS Boro Construction Donald E. Reisinger Inc McCarthy Construction Waer Brl:zker Bla;
BASE BID NO BID S 502,248.00| § 286,460.00 NO BID S 412,000.00

ALTERNATES

KN-1 AC FOR IDF SERVER ROOMS N/A N/A N/A

KN-2 AC FOR WORK ROOMS N/A N/A N/A

WS AC FOR SENSORY RGO $ 79,260.00 | $ 32,800.00 $ 24,500.00
KN-4 NEW AUTOMATIC

TEMPERAURE CONTROLS FOR N/A N/A N/A
BUILDING

ALTERNATES SUB-TOTAL: $ £ 5 79,260.00 | $ 32,800.00 | $ = S 24,500.00

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATES: 3 581,508.00 | 5 319,260.00 $ 436,500.00
UNIT PRICES

(1) lineal ft 4" high rubber base ) 2.00 [ S 3.50 S 2.00
(1) sq. ft resilient tile flooring S 50.00 N/A N/A

(1) sq yd of carpeting S 100.00 | $ 75.00 S 30.00
1) sq ft suspended acoustic

{ ) - . S 5.00| § 5.60 S 5.00
ceiling system type 1

BID PACKAGE CHECK LIST

BID BOND (10%) X X X
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT X X X

CONTRACTOR EXPERIENCE . o %
RECORD

PW EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION 5 s N

FORM

ADDENDUM RECEIPT

NO. 1 X X X

NO. 2 X X X




PROJECT:
PROJECT NUMBER:
BID OPENING DATE & TIME:

RE-BID HVAC REPLACEMENTS AT KNAPP ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS

2016139.02

THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 9, 2017, 2PM

CONTRACT:

HVAC CONSTRUCTION- PAGE 2

BIDDERS stcﬁberg VB, Miehasical; ne Matchline Mechanical, | Myco Mechanical, | Rogers Mechanical Tri-Cc')unt\,r
Mechanical, LLC LEC: Inc. Co. Mechanical, Inc.

BASE BID NO BID NO BID S 1,162,000.00 $ 1,224,000.00 NO BID 1,196,000.00
ALTERNATES
KN-1 AC FOR IDF SERVER ROOMS S 47,000.00 | S 39,800.00 55,000.00
KN-2 AC FOR WORK ROOMS S 85,000.00 | 71,600.00 72,500.00
KN-3 AC FOR SENSORS S 52,000.00 | S 56,400.00 57,600.00
KN-4 NEW AUTOMATIC
TEMPERATURE CONTROLS FOR S 228,150.00 | S 268,000.00 277,500.00
BUILDING
TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATES: S 1,574,150.00 | $ 1,659,800.00 1,658,600.00
UNIT PRICES
NONE
BID PACKAGE CHECK LIST
BID BOND (10%) X X X
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT X X X
CONTRACTOR EXPERIENCE

0 X X
RECORD
PW EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION X X g
FORM
ADDENDUM RECEIPT
NO. 1 X X X
NO. 2 X X X




PROJECT:
PROJECT NUMBER:

RE-BID HVAC REPLACEMENTS AT KNAPP ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS

2016139.02

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 9, 2017, 2PM CONTRACT: HVAC CONSTRUCTION-PAGE 1

BIDDERS AHStat?S Boro Caonstruction Five Star, Inc. Pramsn Michanical,| Gem Mechanical, Gaudelli Bros., Inc.
Mechanical Inc. Inc.

BASE BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,180,000.00|$  1,375,000.00 NO BID NO BID

ALTERNATES

KN-1 AC FOR IDF SERVER ROOMS 5 5400000 | 57,000.00

KKN-2 AC FOR WORK ROOMS S 65,000.00 | $ 94,000.00

KN-3 AC FOR SENSORY ROOM S 52,000.00 | § 100,000.00

KN-4 NEW AUTOMATIC

TEMPERATURE CONTROLS FOR $  268,000.00 | $ 275,000.00

BUILDING

ALTERNATES SUB-TOTAL: > - | $ 43900000 |5  506,000.00 | $ = |9 -

$ 1,619,000.00 | $§ 1,881,000.00

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATES:

UNIT PRICES

NONE

BID PACKAGE CHECK LIST

BID BOND (10%) X X
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT X X
CONTRACTOR EXPERIENCE

RECORD X X
PW EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION

FORM A .
ADDENDUM RECEIPT

NO. 1 X X
NO. 2 X X




PROJECT:
PROJECT NUMBER:
BID OPENING DATE & TIME:

RE-BID HVAC REPLACEMENTS AT KNAPP ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS
2016139.02
THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 9, 2017, 2PM

CONTRACT: HVAC CONSTRUCTION-PAGE 3

Worth & Company,

BIDDERS

Inc.
BASE BID $  1,175,000.00
ALTERNATES

41,750.00
KN-1 AC FOR IDF SERVER ROOMS » !
KN-2 AC FOR WORK ROOMS $ 60,000.00
KN-3 AC FOR SENSOR ROOMS S 50,000.00

KN-4 NEW AUTOMATIC
TEMPERATURE CONTROLS FOR
BUILDING

5 250,000.00

ALTERNATES SUB-TOTAL:

S 401,750.00

TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATES:

$  1,576,750.00

UNIT PRICES

NONE

BID PACKAGE CHECK LIST

BID BOND (10%) X
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT X
CONTRACTOR EXPERIENCE X
RECORD

PW EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION

FORM #
ADDENDUM RECEIPT

NO. 1 X
NO. 2 0




PROIJECT:
PROJECT NUMBER:

RE-BID HVAC REPLACEMENTS AT KNAPP ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS
2016139.02

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 9, 2017, 2PM CONTRACT: ELECTRICAL CONSTRUCTION
BIDDERS AJM Electric, Inc. A.N. Lynch Co., Inc. Electri-Tech Hobbs & Company, Inc. S&S Electrical Services, Inc. Wescott Electric CO.
BASE BID S 435,000.00 NO BID 5 525,000.00 NO BID NO BID S 634,900.00
ALTERNATES
KN-1 AC FOR IDF SERVER ROOMS > e > LA00A0 3 LR60.00
KN-2 AC FOR WORK ROOMS S 10,000.00 S 6,200.00 S 9,000.00
KN-3 AC FOR SENSORY ROOM $ 14,000.00 $ 4,200.00 $ 9,000.00
KN-4 NEW AUTOMATIC
TEMPERATURE CONTROLS FOR S 17,000.00 5 6,500.00 S 9,000.00
BUILDING
ALTERNATES SUB-TOTAL: $ 48,000.00 $ 18,700.00 | § . R 34,000.00
483,000. 543,700.00 668,900.0
TOTAL BASE BID + ALTERNATES: 3 100.00 s ° .
UNIT PRICES
1. Duplex receptacle & wiring S 800.00 S 830.00 S 350.00
2. Exit sign & wiring S 1,000.00 N/A N/A
3. 2x4 light fixture & wiring S 600.00 5 510.00 S 400.00
700. B H
4. Heat or smoke detector & wiring ’ 0aieg $ 767.00 $ sen 00
5. Fire alarm pull station & wiring 3 2000 > 82l ’ =
. Fi i isual
6 Fn.'e alarm a!.l-d:ble/wsua s 800.00 3 647.00 S 400.00
appliance & wiring
7. Jouneyman electrician labor S 120.00 S 111.92 S 150.00
8. Paging speaker 5 750.00 5 629.00 $ 400.00

BID PACKAGE CHECK LIST

BID BOND (10%) X X X
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT X X X
CONTRACTOR EXPERIENCE

X X X
RECORD
PW EMPLOYMENT VERIFICATION

X X X
FORM
ADDENDUM RECEIPT X
NO. 1 X X X
NO. 2 X X




